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ABSTRACT 
 

This study aims to investigate the implementation of multiliteracies 
pedagogy in English language teaching in order to foster students' 
multimodal communicative competence. Twenty students from the 
English language department at IAIN Curup participated in this case 
study, which was of the qualitative variety. The data for the study were 
gathered through participant observation and interviewing, as well as the 
examination of artifacts created by the students. The information 
gathered from these tools was subjected to a qualitative analysis, during 
which thematic and categorical coding were utilized. The findings of this 
research indicate that the implementation of a multiliteracies-based 
pedagogy can foster the development of five competencies that are 
essential to multimodal communicative competence. These competencies 
are linguistic competence, sociocultural competence, interactional 
competence, discourse competence, and multimodal competence. 
Meanwhile, the other two competencies, strategic competence and 
formulaic competence, are somewhat hampered due to a lack of exposure 
to authentic English language. 
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INTRODUCTION 
The landscape of human life has been drastically altered as a result 

of the rise of globalization, digitization, and the emergence of the fourth 
industrial revolution (Cope & Kalantzis, 2015b; Fandiño, 2013; Gleason, 
2018; Varis, 2007). At the moment, there are two crucial changes are 
going on. First, societies are becoming more and more globalized and 
getting more diverse in terms of culture and language. Therefore, the 
capacity to communicate effectively across cultural boundaries and in a 
variety of Englishes, as well as other languages, will be an important 
factor in determining effective citizenship and productive work.. Second, 
various text forms that correspond to ICT are growing massively and 
getting more and more multimodal. The meaning-making in these texts 
does not rely solely on the linguistic forms, but rather it combines both 
the linguistic mode of meaning-making with other modes such as visual, 
audio, oral, gestural, and spatial (Cope & Kalantzis, 2009; Mills, 2010b, 
2010a; New London Group, 1996). 

The interface among various modes in communication have led to 
changes in the way we look at language and literacy practices (Cope & 
Kalantzis, 2009; Durrant & Green, 2000; Gee, 2000; Kress, 2003; Mills, 
2010a; New London Group, 1996). Literacy instruction and literacy 
practice are both undergoing significant shifts as a direct result of cultural 
variations and the evolution of communication channels. The traditional 
understanding of literacy, which places a significant amount of emphasis 
on standardized, single-language, single-cultural, and rule-governed 
reading and writing, is not sufficient to meet the demand that is necessary 
to fully participate in public, community, and economic life (Cope & Mary 
Kalantzis, 2000). The conventional understanding of literacy has started 
to become less useful as a result of the proliferation of numerous texts 
within the mainstream media as well as on the World Wide Web and the 
force of globalization, both of which help to enable the formation of 
numerous meaning-making modes. The traditional approach to teaching 
reading and writing is incapable of adequately preparing children to 
engage actively in today's society. 

Under these conditions, a number of academics have argued that 
there is a pressing need to broaden both the concept of and the scope of 
literacy instruction and learning. The concept of literacy instruction 
needs to be expanded such that it includes teaching students the skills and 
knowledge necessary to grasp, produce, and communicate meaning in 
multimodal texts that are appropriate for a variety of sociocultural 
settings. (Cope & Kalantzis, 2015b; Kellner, 2001; Kress, 2003; Mills, 2010a; 

New London Group, 2000; Zammit, 2010; Zammit & Downes, 2002) 
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As a result, second and foreign language education must expand 
beyond a focus on acquiring grammatical competence and practical 
communication skills (Suherdi, 2012b, 2012a; Taylor, 2009). For 
example, in TESOL (Teaching English to Speakers of Other Languages), 
learners are expected to not only understand and write texts that are 
culturally and contextually relevant, but also use language effectively 
across a range of social contexts (Bianco, 2000; Royce, 2002, 2007; R. 
Stenglin & Iedema, 2001). Multimodal communicative competence 
(hereafter MCC), as argued by Royce (2007), should be a primary focus of 
language instruction in light of the proliferation of different types of 
multimodal texts. It is important to educate students with the expertise 
necessary to interpret, create, and convey meaning through multimodal 
literature.  

MCC highlights the importance of students’ analytical skills. Using 
these skills, students analyze and critically examine the features and the 
strategies used in the text to coherently convey meaning that is relevant 
in terms of culture and context. These skills help students understand the 
co-occurring nature of the interface between various modes and how they 
display their meaning in tandem. Students use their analytical skills to 
comprehend how the mixed meanings produced by diverse modes 
frequently result in a visual and verbal partnership, allowing for a greater 
and more full communication of meaning than would be feasible with 
simply one modality. Finally, the skills enable students to use, 
comprehend, and construct semiotic resources correctly and 
meaningfully (Coccetta, 2018; Ruiz-Madrid & Valeiras-Jurado, 2020).  

Multiliteracies pedagogy provides viable options in response to 
such issues (New London Group, 1996). It provides a more holistic view 
of literacy instruction by include consideration for linguistic and cultural 
diversity. Multiliteracies education encourages critical engagement and 
gives students access to the ever-evolving language of labor, power, and 
society, empowering them to define their social futures and find success 
through satisfying employment (Cope & Kalantzis, 2009; New London 
Group, 1996). In foreign language learning, multiliteracies pedagogy 
addresses the broader concept of literacy to embrace the ability to use 
and to construe coherent and meaningful texts that are relevant to social 
purposes (Kern, 2000, p.6). Additionally, multiliteracies pedagogy 
prepares learners to participate actively in real-life contexts (Warner & 
Dupuy, 2018; Willis Allen & Paesani, 2010). Multiliteracies pedagogy 
offers the teaching devices to develop students’ literacy by incorporating 
four knowledge processes: (1) experiencing, (2) conceptualizing, (3) 
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analyzing, and (4) applying. These knowledge processes integrate and 
align the learning of language forms with authentic texts (Anderson & 
Krathwol, 2001; Bloom et al., 1956). Multiliteracies pedagogy bridges 
language and content and provides a pedagogical experience that is 
coherent and well-articulated (Menke et al., 2018). 

In addition, there is substantial evidence supporting the 
usefulness of multiliteracies pedagogy and knowledge processes in a 
variety of linguistically and culturally diverse settings, including English 
as a Second Language (ESL) instruction (Burke & Hardware, 2015). Some 
studies have yielded empirical evidence of multiliteracies pedagogy 
implementation on various areas such as students’ experiences, students’ 
learning outcomes,  and students’ perceptions (Byrnes et al., 2010; 
Paesani, 2016; Maxim, 2002), the implementation of the framework in 
numerous settings of education ( Redmann & Sederberg, 2017; Paesani et 
al., 2015), teacher perceptions and understandings of the framework 
(Paesani, 2013), the application of knowledge process in foreign language 
teaching (e.g. Bhooth, Azman, & Ismail, 2014; Michelson & Beatrice 
Dupuy, 2014), and material analysis using multiliteracies and knowledge 
process framework (e.g. Menke et al., 2018; Rowland et al., 2016). Other 
studies in the ESL context identify that the implementation of 
multiliteracies pedagogy can encourage students’ positive writing 
identity (Hughes & Morrison, 2014), and positive literate identity (Black, 
2009; Thorne et al., 2009). The use of multimodal representation has 
been proven to improve communication (S. L. Cohen, 2011; Hughes & 
Morrison, 2014). 

In relation to the use of multiliteracies pedagogy in the English as 
a Foreign Language (EFL) environment in Indonesia, some research have 
been carried out to investigate the effects of applying multiliteracies 
pedagogy. (Nabhan, 2019; Hapsari, 2019; Ikasari et al.; Drajati et al., 2018, 
2019; Januarty & Nima, 2018; Kustini, 2021; Nabhan & Hidayat, 2018; 
Nuryani et al., 2019; Suherdi, 2015 Cahyaningati & Lestari, 2018). For 
instance, Kustini's (2021) research on the application of multiliteracies 
pedagogy in an English for Specific Purposes classroom found that 
students exhibited positive engagement and motivation. The research 
also showed that the use of multiliteracies teaching in the classroom has 
the potential to enhance students' knowledge as well as their capacity to 
comprehend and produce multimodal texts. An especially fascinating 
finding from the research was that a student who had performed poorly 
academically was able to communicate her awareness of her improved 
English skills, as well as her confidence and drive in studying and utilizing 
English. (Kustini, 2021, p.174). 
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Even though there is more and more interest in the multiliteracies 
pedagogy framework, there are still some gaps in what we know about it 
in the EFL context. First, most of the research on how multiliteracies 
pedagogy is used has been done at the elementary and secondary school 
levels. Only a few studies at the college level have been done. Second, 
there have been many studies, but one important topic that hasn't been 
looked into much is how teachers use the framework to help students 
learn how to understand and create multimodal text. (Royce, 2002, 2007). 

Taking all of these things into account, as well as the need to give 
more systematic advice on how to implement multiliteracies pedagogy in 
ELT, this study looks into how multiliteracies pedagogy is used at the 
tertiary level. It goes into more detail about how the four pedagogical 
moves in Multiliteracies Pedagogy and Knowledge Process (New London 
Group, 1996; Cope & Kalantzis, 2015a) help students develop their 
multimodal communication skills. 

 
THEORITICAL FRAMEWORK 
The Pedagogy of Multiliteracies 

The New London Group, which consisted of several literacy 
scholars from different countries, met in New London in September 1994. 
The group met to discuss the current condition and the potential of 
literacy instructions. Their main focus was on how literacy instructions 
had to adapt to the society which was getting more and more globalized 
and getting more diverse in terms of culture and language, and various 
text forms that correspond to ICT which were growing massively and 
were getting more and more multimodal (Mills, 2010b, 2010a; Cope & 
Kalantzis, 2009; New London Group, 1996). 

This study looks at how multiliteracies pedagogy is used at the 
tertiary level. It takes all of these things into account, as well as the need 
to give more systematic advice on how to use multiliteracies pedagogy in 
ELT. It goes into more detail about how the four pedagogical moves in 
Multiliteracies Pedagogy and Knowledge Process (New London Group, 
1996; Cope & Kalantzis, 2015a) help students improve their multimodal 
communication skills (New London Group, 1996).  Literacy instruction in 
today's schools must cultivate students' multiliteracies and ensure that it 
can build students' capacity to become independent individuals who can 
successfully participate in a variety of settings throughout their lives 
(Anstey & Bull, 2018; New London Group, 2000).  

The New London Group proposed "multiliteracies pedagogy" as a 
reaction to the desire for expanding the scope of literacy instruction, and 
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this background served as the impetus for the New London Group's 
advocacy of this approach. Literacy instruction, according to the 
pedagogy of multiliteracies, should take into account the diverse array of 
cultures and texts that are present in the modern, globalized world, which 
is becoming more multicultural and multilingual. In addition to this, it 
should take into account the growing number of text formats that are 
associated with ICT. This involves taking into consideration familiarity 
with and mastery of multimodal meaning-making and its applications. 
(New London Group, 2000; Cope & Kalantzis, 2015a).   

When it comes to the multiliteracies theory, the multimodality 
theory and the work done by Kress have made substantial contributions 
to the design concept that is at the heart of the multiliteracies approach. 
In addition to this, a number of studies have highlighted the significance 
of multimodal characteristics in multiliteracies. (Eteokleous et al., 2015; 
Hill, 2004; Kist & Pytash, 2015; Leu, 2000; Lynch, 2015; Mcnabb, 2006; 
O’Byrne et al., 2014; Rabadán, 2015).  

Situated practice, overt instruction, critical framing, and 
transformed practice are the four pedagogical components that make up 
the how of multiliteracies. These four pedagogical components allow the 
pedagogy of multiliteracies to accommodate the interconnections of the 
elements or modes of design (New London Group, 1996).  

Situated practice mentions that all learners' affective and 
sociocultural needs and identities should be considered in a pedagogy 
(New London Group, 1996, p.85). In this pedagogical move, according to 
their unique teaching situations and students' needs, teachers must 
develop a variety of teaching and learning approaches. In addition to this, 
teachers have the responsibility of guiding students in the process of 
drawing parallels between their academic and personal lives. Overt 
instruction is the second component, and it refers to the way in which 
teachers aid their students' learning through the delivery of direct and 
explicit lessons (New London Group, 1996). During over instruction, 
teachers provide students with several forms of scaffolding to help them 
achieve the aim of learning. The third part of this move is called critical 
framing. This component's goal is to aid students in the development of 
their critical thinking skills by assisting them in the recognition of the 
contexts of their learning and the connection of what they learn to wider 
contexts. Students use critical analysis, interpretation, deconstruction, 
and reconstruction to reconstruct their own body of knowledge and 
practices. The final component, transformed practice, involves students 
reflecting on prior knowledge and transforming it into a fresh design 
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informed by their own objectives and convictions. (New London Group, 
1996).  

The multiliteracies pedagogical framework has undergone several 
iterations since it was initially introduced. The project's Learning by 
Design phase is one of the most crucial. Cope and Kalantzis reinterpret 
and transform the framework of the New London Groups into "a more 
productive, relevant, inventive, creative, and emancipatory education" 
(Cope & Kalantzis, 2009). (Cope & Kalantzis, 2009, p. 175). Knowledge 
Processes is their phrase for the pedagogical movements of experiencing 
(situated practice), conceptualizing (overt instruction), analyzing (critical 
framing), and applying (transformed practice). 

Experiencing comprises both the known and the new, thus 
students should consider their prior knowledge and experiences as well 
as participate in the new experiences they acquire when immersed in 
real-world situations. As regard to conceptualizing, it is possible to 
conceptualize through naming and theorizing, so students should be able 
to describe and categorize the knowledge and experiences they have had 
as well as be able to generalize and connect their conceptions with one 
another. In terms of analysing, students should be able to investigate 
logical connections and the function of meaning while also critically 
considering them. This is known as functional and critical analysis. 
Applying should be done properly and creatively, which calls for students 
to put their knowledge to use in the current world and creatively adapt it 
to other situations (Cope & Kalantzis, 2015b, 2015a).     

Teachers can rearrange and combine the moves as they see fit. 
They decide the best course of action based on how well the students 
performed in each previous move (Cope & Kalantzis, 2015b, 2015a). The 
four pedagogical components should not be treated as separate steps or 
used independently. Rather, there are intentional overlaps and 
connections between them, with some elements taking primacy at 
different periods (New London Group, 1996).  

 

Communicative Competence  
  Chomsky's ideas on competence and performance form the basis 
for what we now call "communicative competence." Chomsky defines 
competence as the knowledge of language and performance as the ability 
to use the underlying system with interlocutors in real-world 
circumstances. (Chomsky, 1965). Hymes (1972) came up with the term 
"communicative competence" in response to Chomsky's claim that 
competence is different from performance. According to Hymes, making 
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such distinction undermines the importance of language as a social 
activity. As a result, it places more emphasis on grammatical knowledge 
than on interpersonal skills and treats competence as a universal rather 
than a culturally specific concept (Hymes, 1972). Hymes suggests that 
consideration of sociocultural factors is essential to comprehending 
communicative competency. He thinks that the most important aspects of 
communicative competence are speakers' awareness of linguistic and 
sociolinguistic norms and their ability to apply this awareness in 
conversation (Hymes, 1972).  
  Building on Hymes's work, Canale and Swain developed a 
complete model of communicative competence in 1980. (Canale & Swain, 
1980). The theory of their communicative competence rests on three 
main pillars: grammatical competence, sociolinguistic competence, and 
strategic competence. To be grammatically proficient, one must be well-
versed in a language's lexicon, as well as its grammar, syntax, 
morphology, and phonology. The second type of competence is known as 
"socio-linguistic competence," and it entails familiarity with both 
discourse norms and social customs. The ability to adapt one's verbal and 
nonverbal methods in the face of a communication failure is what we 
mean by "strategic competence." (Canale & Swain, 1980, p. 29-31).  
  Three years after establishing their first model, Canale and Swain 
(1983) amended the model by adding discourse competence as a fourth 
component. This competency is demonstrated by formal cohesiveness 
and semantic coherence. Together, these two components create a 
coherent text (Canale, 1983, p.9). In the 1990s, as a continuation of Canale 
and Swain's approach, Celce-Murcia et al. proposed a new model of 
communicative competence (Eghtesadi & Beheshti, 2017). Five 
competencies are included in their model. (1) discourse competence, (2) 
language competence, (3) sociocultural competence, (4) strategic 
competence, and (5) actional competency (Celce-Murcia et al., 1995). This 
alternative paradigm positions actional competence, sociocultural 
competence, and linguistic competence as the three points of a triangle 
surrounding discourse competence, with all three being controlled and 
supported by strategic competence in the outer circle. 
  In 2007, Celce-Murcia revised her model of communicative 
competency. The model incorporates six competencies: linguistic, 
discourse, formulaic, interactional, sociocultural, and strategic. Figure 2 
is a schematic illustration of the revised model. The new model preserves 
the top-down nature of sociocultural competence with the addition of 
formulaic competence and the transformation of actional competence 
into interactional competence. This model demonstrates a dynamic 
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hierarchy between cultural instruction, discourse shaped by context, and 
a balance between language as a system and language as a form. Thus, the 
model emphasizes interaction and diverse strategies (Celce-Murcia, 
2008). Sociocultural competence, located at the top of the diagram, is 
defined as the speaker's practical knowledge of how to effectively 
articulate messages within the entire social and cultural framework of 
communication.   
  Discourse competence refers to the ability to produce coherent 
spoken messages through the selection, arrangement, and sequencing of 
words, structures, and utterances. The four major components of 
discourse competence are coherence, deixis, cohesion, and generic 
structure. Conventions regarding the use of reference, substitution, 
conjunction, and lexical chains constitute cohesion. Deixis is the 
situational grounding accomplished through the use of personal 
pronouns, special terms, temporal terns, and textual reference (Celce-
Murcia, 2008). The following competency is linguistic proficiency. This 
includes phonological, lexical, morphological, and syntactic knowledg  
  A new component, formulaic competence, is introduced in the 
revised model of Celce-Murcia. Different from linguistic competence, 
formulaic competence concerns with conventional linguistic and fixed 
expressions that are mostly used in daily interaction. Routines, 
collocations, idioms, and lexical frames all fall under the category of 
formulaic competence. Celce-Murcia argues that formulaic competence is 
an important component to include in communicative competence. As a 
matter of fact, formulaic expressions are frequently used by fluent 
speakers or native speakers of a language compare to systematic 
linguistic expressions when they take part in actual communication 
events (Celce-Murcia, 2008).  
  Actional competence is transformed into interactional 
competence in the revised version of the Celce-Murcia model. This 
competency encompasses a total of three other competencies. There are 
three types of competence: conversational competence, 
nonverbal/paralinguistic competence, and actional competence. In 
conclusion, the updated model still possesses the same level of strategic 
competence. This competency includes some strategies that can be used 
in communication, such as strategies for achieving goals, strategies for 
stalling or gaining time, strategies for monitoring oneself, strategies for 
interacting with others, and social strategies. (Celce-Murcia, 2008). 
 In the literature on communicative competence, other models that 
resemble "communicative competence," such as Bachman's language 
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ability model, have been proposed. Instead of focusing on language 
teaching, these models are based on language assessment (Celce-Murcia, 
2008). Thus, Canale and Swain's (l980) model, supported by elaborations 
of Canale's (l983) model, more frequently the issues to be discussed in 
communicative competence discourse as well as related issues in 
language pedagogy and applied linguistics (Celce-Murcia, 2008). 
However, in this current study, the formulation of multimodal 
communicative competence was based on Celce-model Murcia's of 
communicative competence (2007). 
 
Multimodal Communicative Competence 

Visuals have frequently been utilized as a foundation for many 
teaching strategies in the L2 setting, such as stimulating discussion, 
building vocabulary, or encouraging students to apply their social 
knowledge and develop predictions (Stenglin & Iedema, 2001). As 
something that is socially and culturally constructed as well as having its 
own grammar, visuals have not received much attention. Additionally, 
visuals are more often excluded from the concept of second language 
proficiency or communicative competence (Royce, 2002).  

According to Royce (2007), the goal of language instruction must 
be reconsidered in light of the proliferation of new forms of 
communication made possible by technological progress. Language 
education today should focus on enhancing students' ability to 
communicate effectively across a variety of media. It is important to equip 
students with the resources they need to cultivate their capacity for 
multimodal interpretation and meaning-making. 

Royce (2002) proposes the idea of MCC by reconsidering Hymes’ 
traditional view on communicative competence, which mainly focuses on 
linguistic aspects, and considers the need to include multimodal literacy. 
Comparable to the New London Group's multiliteracies, Royce's concept 
of multimodal communicative competence is nonetheless tailored to the 
English as a Second Language (ESL) and English as a Foreign Language 
(EFL) settings. Royce believes that it is not enough to focus merely on 
language; hence, he incorporates visuals into the teaching of language. He 
maintains that in a language class, the teacher should develop the 
teaching of metalanguage that can help students develop their visual 
literacy. This literacy will help students to comprehend and produce texts 
that incorporate linguistic modes and visual or other modes. He also notes 
that adopting this strategy in the language classroom helps students 
better understand sociocultural and ideological aspects of the language 
being studied (Royce, 2007: 367). 
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This current study adopts the communicative competence 
framework proposed by Celce-Murcia’s model as its foundation. The 
model is enhanced by Royce's multimodal competence (Royce, 2007, 
2013) to form a proposed model of multimodal communicative 
competence. 

 
Figure 1. Multimodal communicative competence model 

 
Celce-Murcias' framework of communicative competence is 

preserved in the proposed framework of multimodal communicative 
competence, with multimodal competence situated within the circle that 
encloses the other six competences. Each of the other communicative 
competences relies on more than one mode of meaning making, as 
indicated by multimodal competence's position at the center of the 
diagram. (Sukyadi et al., 2018). For instance, the application of linguistic 
competence in its intended context calls for the use of gestures or visual 
illustration. 

The necessity for students to deal with the various ways that each 
mode uniquely realizes its contextualized meanings is not the only aspect 
of multimodal communicative competence. Instead, it focuses on how 
students can develop their multimodal interpretation and meaning-
construction skills in a variety of contexts. Students must therefore 
possess the knowledge and abilities necessary to analyze or create texts 
that coherently convey meaning that is relevant in terms of culture and 
context. Students should be aware that this will necessitate drawing on 
their understanding of what constitutes informational cohesion in a 
multimodal text. Students should also be able to apply their knowledge of 
how various modes can maintain the same forms of address to audiences 
or realize similar and opposing attitudes within the confines of a single 
text. Finally, students should be able to compose meanings in multimodal 
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texts by comprehending how the verbal and visual modes can collaborate 
to create convincing meanings on the page or screen. 

Multimodal communicative competence focuses on the semantic 
interrelation between the two modes of communication on the page or 
screen. It highlights the importance of knowledge and skills to 
understand, produce, and communicate the incorporation of two modes 
into a single text. It focuses on the knowledge and abilities needed by both 
students and teachers to deal with the co-occurring nature of the two 
modes and how they display their meaning in tandem. It also involves the 
skills and understanding of how these mixed meanings frequently result 
in a visual and verbal partnership, allowing for a greater and more full 
communication of meaning than would be feasible with simply one 
modality. 

 

RESEARCH METHODOLOGY 
The present study used a qualitative case study research design to 

answer the objectives and questions posed in the introduction. A 
qualitative case study research design may have been appropriate for this 
study for the following reasons: First, Researchers in this study zeroed in 
on a specific cohort of ESL students who had been exposed to 
multiliteracies pedagogy while learning English. (L. Cohen et al., 2007; 
Creswell, 2007; Creswell & Poth, 2018; Hancock & Bob Algozzine, 2006; 
Yin, 2003). Second, the case study provided readers with a compelling 
illustration of real people dealing with a specific challenge, which made it 
easier for them to comprehend the phenomenon in its natural context. (L. 
Cohen et al., 2007; Creswell, 2007; Creswell & Poth, 2018; Gering, 2007; 
Yin, 2003). Third, this research made use of a variety of evidence sources 
in order to perform triangulation, which makes it possible to comprehend 
the situation in its entirety. (Yin, 2003). A case study provides a detailed 
data collection taken from multiple sources to assist understanding and 
to make the analysis of individuals’ behaviour (Yin, 2018).  

Twenty individuals were used in this analysis. Bachelor's degree 
holders, they were second-semester student teachers. Students with at 
least one semester of experience with introductory-level English courses 
were prioritized in the selection process. As a result, they were classified 
as students with the potential to acquire functional English proficiency. 
Having a firm foundation in English could help them progress rapidly in 
their studies of the language. They also had some exposure to ICT in their 
early education, which contributed to their general acceptance as having 
a foundational understanding of computers and the internet. The 
researcher assumed that the study's English and technological literacy 
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tasks would be manageable for the participants. In addition, the next thing 
that was taken into consideration was the possibility that these student 
teachers will have a good opportunity in the not-too-distant future to 
utilize in their own teaching what they have experienced and learned 
while participating in this program. Classroom observation, student 
interviews, and student artifacts were the three different sources of data 
that were utilized in this current study. In this study, the triangulation of 
data was used, which requires these various sources of data in order for 
the researcher to have a comprehensive understanding of the 
phenomenon being studied (Yin, 2003). In addition to that, it offered 
readers a wealth of perspectives on the phenomena that were the subject 
of this research (Cohen et al., 2007). 

 
RESULTS & DISCUSSION 
Results  
  The purpose of this study was to investigate the efficacy of a 
multiliteracies teaching program in assisting students in the development 
of their multimodal communicative competence. To portray the 
development of multimodal communicative competence, one diagnostic 
project and two digital projects were assigned. In each project, students 
were required to: (1) write a descriptive text; (2) produce a digital poster; 
and (3) produce a video. A rubric on multimodal communicative 
competence was used to evaluate students’ artefacts. The following table 
gives an overview of the projects' average scores: 

Table 1 
Score on Students’ Project 

NO 
 

Average Score 
Diagnostic Project 2 Project3 

 Average 
Score 

70.10 74.31 79.41 

 
 The table presented the students’ average score on the three 

projects assigned to them during the program. The data indicated that 
during the course of implementing multiliteracies pedagogy, students’ 
multimodal communicative competence developed. It was indicated by 
the improvement of the average score from the diagnostic project of 
70.10 to the last project of 79.41 

The rise in the mean score seemed to indicate that students' 
capability of understanding the combined potential of various modes for 
making meanings had gradually developed over time. This ability is 
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required in order to make sense of texts and construct them. To put it 
another way, the application of various pedagogical maneuvers was 
successful in cultivating multimodal communicative competence in the 
students. 

 In terms of linguistic competence, students' artefacts revealed a 
gradual development in their linguistic competence. The following 
evidence could be used to justify the improvement of students’ linguistic 
competence: First, their diagnostic to project 2 scores demonstrated 
progress. The results of the students' evaluation of their linguistic 
competence are provided in the table below. 

Table 2 
Score on Linguistic Competence 

Project Score 

Diagnostic Project 1 Project 2 

Descriptive Text (1 - 
3) 

2 2 3 

Digital Poster (1 - 3) 2 3 3 

Video Animation (1- 
3) 

2 3 3 

 It can be inferred from the table that, in general, students’ 
linguistic competence improved. It is indicated by the increase in the 
average score of the three projects. For example, students’ average score 
in descriptive text exceeds from 2 in diagnostic to 3 in task 2. The score in 
digital poster improved from 2 in diagnostic project to in project 1 and 
project 2. The score in video animation project progressed from 2 in 
diagnostic project to 3 in project 1 and project 2. The score may indicate 
that students have developed their linguistic competence. 

 Second, a qualitative analysis of student artifacts revealed that the 
quality of students' projects was improving in terms of syntactic, 
phonological, morphological, orthographic, and lexical features. 
Following the application of multiliteracies pedagogy, Students can 
display good command and usage of grammatical structures such as 
phrase structure, word order, various sorts of sentences, sentence special 
construction, modifier use, coordination, subordination, and embedding. 
They also have the potential to assist in the correction of grammatical 
errors. They made effective use of both content and function words, as 
well as accurate use of grammatical inflection, productive derivational 
processes, and parts of speech. Students were able to articulate the 
pronunciation of vowels, consonants, and syllables, as well as the use of 
prominence, intonation, stress, and rhythm. In terms of phonological 
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features, students were able to articulate these aspects of speech. 
Additionally, the projects highlighted the students' mastery of 
orthographic variables. They exhibited correct letter usage, phoneme-
grapheme relationships, spelling norms, mechanical conventions, and 
punctuation, among other things. 

  The result of the students’ project supports the indication 
that students have developed their awareness of the sociocultural aspect 
of communication. The following table shows the result. 

Table 3 
Average Score on Sociocultural Competence 

Project Average Score 
Diagnostic Project 1 Project 2 

Descriptive Text (1 - 3) 1.25 1.3 1.95 
Digital Poster (1 - 3) 1.25 1.6 1.95 
Video Animation (1- 3) 1.25 1.3 2 

  
  The table displays the average communication competence 

score of students. The diagnostic score for the video animation project is 
1.25, while the scores for projects 1 and 2 are 1.3 and 2, respectively. The 
application of multiliteracies instruction has increased students' 
awareness of culture and norms, which govern the use of dialects or 
varieties, registers, natural or idiomatic expressions, cultural references, 
and figurative language. After completing the multiliteracies program, 
students were able to articulate task-appropriate communication 
objectives. They presented pertinent, supporting, and completely 
convincing arguments in support of the communication objectives. In 
addition, they have a solid command of the appropriate word register and 
social awareness for the circumstance. 

  Students’ development of formulaic competence can be 
seen from the improvement of their project score. The table below shows 
students’ average score on formulaic competence. 

 
Table 4 

Average Score on Formulaic competence 
Project Average Score 

Diagnostic Project 1 Project 2 

Descriptive Text  (1 - 3) 1.25 1.3 1.9 
Digital Poster (1 - 3) 1.25 1.75 2.1 
Video Animation (1 - 3) 1.55 1.85 2.55 
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  In general, students’ formulaic scores progress in the three 
projects. For example, in the video animation project, students’ scores for 
the diagnostic test are 1.55, which improves to 2.55 in task 2. It implies 
that there is improvement in the students’ formulaic competence. 
  The score on formulaic competence is also supported by data from 
descriptive text, video projects, and their interaction during the 
communicative activities. Routines, fixed phrases, collocations, idioms, 
and lexical frames are found in those activities. 
  However, not all of the students could develop their formulaic 
competence. The data from students’ project and the classroom 
interaction indicated that limited user students did not experience 
progress in this area.  
The pedagogical move of transformed practice facilitated the 
development of students' interactional competence. When students 
engage in communicative activities, their interactional competence 
grows. They can effectively exchange information, perform speech acts, 
and employ nonverbal communication skills. 
  Students' communicative activities provided evidence of their 
interactional competence. Throughout pair work, group work, role play, 
and simulations, the researcher attempted to identify interaction 
competence's articulation. The table below displays the students' 
interactional competence knowledge and skills. 

Table 5 
Score on Students’ Interactional Competence 

Interactional  
Competence  

 

 
                Score 

Actional Competence (1 - 3) 2 
Conversational Competence  (1 - 3) 2.5 
Para Linguistic Competence (1 – 3) 2.5 

   
 The score demonstrates that the students have developed their 
interactional competence. For instance, in paralinguistic competence, 
students received a maximum score of 2.5 out of 5 points. It may indicate 
that students are aware of how to use non-verbal cues to enhance 
communication effectiveness. 
  During the communicative activities, Student demonstrated her 
ability to use common speech acts and speech act sets in the target 
language for interactions involving information exchanges, interpersonal 
exchanges, expression of opinions and feelings (complaining, blaming, 
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regretting, apologizing, etc.), suasion (suggesting, requesting, advising, 
persuading, asking for, etc.), and future scenarios (hopes, goals, promises, 
predictions, etc.). In addition, they were able to implement turn-taking 
systems, such as how to initiate a conversation, how to establish and 
change topics, how to interrupt, how to collaborate, how to assess 
comprehension, etc. 
  Students' descriptive texts reveal that the implementation of 
multiliteracies pedagogy has facilitated the growth of their discourse 
competence. Students are able to produce text that is coherent and 
unified, making full and appropriate use of a variety of organizational 
patterns and a vast array of cohesive devices. They can also use the 
conventions of the text type in question with sufficient flexibility to 
effectively communicate complex ideas, while holding the reader's 
attention and achieving all communication goals. 
  It is also supported by the improvement of students’ average score 
on discourse competence, as it is presented in the table below. 

Table 6 
Average score on Discourse Competence 

Project Average Score  
Diagnostic Project 1 Project 2 

Descriptive Text  (2 - 6) 1.25 1.8 4.25 

Digital Poster (1 - 3) 1.25 3.95 2.1 
Video Animation (1- 3) 1.25 1.85 2.1 

   
 The development of students’ discourse competence can be seen 

from the improvement of students’ average score. For example, students’ 
scores in descriptive text improved from 3.5 to 4.25. This indicates that 
the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy can improve students. 
Discourse competence 
  Since the beginning of the program, there had been an overall 
improvement in the level of discourse competence development among 
the students. Within the scope of their initial undertaking, the mode of 
expression was utilized effectively and was pertinent to the 
communication objective. They were also able to correctly use a variety 
of textual features and contribute to the coherence of the text. Alongside 
the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy, students gradually 
improved her ability to use cohesion devices such as references, 
substitution, conjunction, and parallel structure. These devices were 
effective in preserving the text's coherence and were used by the student 
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to enhance her ability to use cohesion devices. In addition to this, their 
capacity to acquire situational anchoring through personal, spatial, 
temporal, and textual deixis was improved. The coherence of their texts 
was accomplished by articulating the appropriate content schemata, 
managing old and new material, thematization, maintaining temporal 
continuity, and utilizing various organizational schemata. These are all 
methods that are generally recognized as being effective.  It 
is particularly interesting to note that not all students were able to 
cultivate their strategic competence in relation to communication 
strategies. Some of the students were able to improve their skills in the 
various strategies, including achievement strategies, strategies for 
stalling or gaining time, strategies for self-monitoring, strategies for 
interacting with others, and social strategies. However, some students 
had trouble improving their communication strategies despite their best 
efforts. 
 Students' multimodal competence has improved to some degree as a 
direct consequence of the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy in 
the classroom. Students have the ability to thoughtfully design the use of 
color and typography to reflect the chosen visual theme, as well as to 
make meaningful use of available visual elements, such as graphics, in 
order to construct meaning in a manner that is consistent throughout. In 
addition, students have the ability to make use of any animated elements 
or special effects in order to design dynamic sequencing of the content in 
a way that is purposeful and meaningful in order to complement or 
supplement the other design modes for meaning construction in a 
manner that is cohesive. 

This evidence of students’ multimodal competence is also 
indicated by the improvement of students’ scores. 

Table 7 
Multimodal Competence Average Score 

Project Average Score 
Diagnostic Project 1 Project 2 

Digital Poster (3 - 
9) 

4.55 6.9 7.35 

Video Animation 
(3 – 9 

4.55 6.45 7.05 

   
 The score on both digital poster and video animation project 

improves. For example, in the digital poster, the diagnostic score is 4.55 
and it improves in task 2 by a score of 7.35. The improvement in the score 
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indicates that the enactment of multiliteracies pedagogy can, to some 
extent, develop students’ multimodal competence. 

 Along with the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogical 
moves, students gradually improved their ability to understand and 
design multimodal text. After experiencing multiliteracies learning, they 
started to improve their ability to design multimodal text by making use 
of colour and typography. In addition, they demonstrated the ability to 
use selected visual themes and make effective use of available visual 
elements, such as graphics, to create a unified message. Students honed 
their ability to use any animated element design purposefully and 
meaningfully to supplement the other design modes for cohesion in 
meaning construction. Students could utilize any auditory elements, such 
as music, sound effects, or narration, in their video projects with purpose 
and significance. Students improved their compositional skills by 
adopting a specific layout to structure design elements and by utilizing 
text alignment and margins as design elements for cohesive meaning 
construction. 
 
DISCUSSION 

This study reveals that multiliteracies pedagogy combined with 
communicative activities increased students' multimodal communicative 
competence in speaking courses. The students excelled in their learning 
by actively participating in class activities and completing their assigned 
projects.  A number of factors have proven the favourable results of 
teaching program implementation in this study: (1) the use of explicit 
teaching or direct instruction; (2) the use of transformed practice or 
application; (3) the use of multimodal authentic materials; and (4) the use 
of communicative activities. First, the use of explicit instruction in this 
study has the potential to improve students' knowledge of concepts and 
aspects of texts, allowing them to gain conscious awareness and control 
over what they learn during the teaching program. Direct instruction also 
helps students build their skills in using explicit metalanguage to express 
the processes and ingredients that produce meaning. This study confirms 
the claim that direct instruction on the nature of multimodal texts and 
multimodal communicative competence helps students develop their 
understanding of semiotics systems: linguistics (oral and written 
language); visual (still and moving images); auditory (music and sound 
effects); gestural (facial expression and body language); and special 
(layout and organization) (Anstey & Bull, 2018; New London Group, 
1996).  
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Second, the use of transformed practice in this study allows 
students to put what they've learned in prior moves into practice. As a 
result, students' communication skills can improve. Students reflect on 
existing knowledge and convert it into a new design inspired by their own 
objectives and convictions through transformed practice. Students' 
knowledge and skills from situated practice, overt instruction, and critical 
framing will be used in real-world contexts outside of the classroom. This 
study confirms the proposition that by enabling students to relate their 
learning to their cultural experiences and vice versa, transformed 
practice leads to some degree of creative change (Mills, 2006a, 2007). 

Third, in this study, the usage of multimodal authentic texts 
benefits students in two ways. First, authentic texts assist students in 
developing their ability to critically engage with multimodal texts, 
allowing them to comprehend how language (and other semiotic modes) 
are bound. Second, authentic resources expose students not only to new 
language but also to fresh textual messages and ideas conveyed in 
unfamiliar language.  

Fourth, the use of communicative activities in this study is useful 
foster students’ multimodal communicative competence. Communicative 
activities in this study facilitate students’ multimodal communicative 
development in several ways. First, communicative activities facilitate the 
implementation of multimodal communicative competence components. 
Second, the language techniques in communicative activities enable 
students to engage learners in the pragmatic, authentic, functional use of 
language for meaningful purpose. Third, by implementing communicative 
activities students can use the language, productively and receptively, in 
unrehearsed context outside the classroom. Fourth, communicative 
activities provide students opportunities to focus on their own learning 
process through an understanding of their own styles of learning and 
through the development of appropriate strategies for autonomous 
learning. This study confirms the claim that communicative activities can 
improve students’ ability to convey their ideas in the target language 
communicatively (Widdowson, 1978; Breen and Candlin, 1980; Savignon 
1983; Nunan, 1991; Lee & Van Vatten, 1995; Richard-Amato, 1996; 
Brown, 2000).   
 
CONCLUSIONS 

  This study's findings indicate that adopting a 
multiliteracies pedagogy in English language instruction can enhance 
students' multimodal communicative competence. In terms of linguistic 
competence, the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy can improve 
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students' knowledge and skill in all of its components. There is also 
evidence that students' sociocultural competence increased as a result of 
the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy. Regarding formulaic 
competence, some students demonstrate growth in this area. However, 
some individuals do not make progress. The limited exposure of students 
to authentic material outside of the classroom has hindered their 
progress. The findings also indicate that students' interactional 
competence improves in general. Students can also improve their text 
organization knowledge and skills. In accordance with the 
implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy, the findings reveal that 
students' discourse competence grows. The findings regarding students' 
strategic competence, as opposed to their discourse competence, paint a 
different picture of their development. There does not appear to be any 
improvement among the limited users. The strategic competence of 
competent and intermediate users, however, can be enhanced. In 
accordance with the implementation of multiliteracies pedagogy, 
multimodal competence develops among students, according to this 
study's findings. Furthermore, they must be able to comprehend and 
produce texts in multimodal ways that are culturally and contextually 
significant (Bianco, 2000; Royce, 2002, 2007; R. Stenglin & Iedema, 2001). 
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